BID COMPARISON

Lewisburg Cumberland Street Phase 1
Village of Lewisburg, Ohio

Prepared: August 7, 2008

Kramer & Associates, LLC Rath Builders Supply Inc. Arcon Builders, LTD Tom's Construciton, Inc.  Brumbaugh Construction, Inc| Double Jay Contruction, Inc.| CA Shindeldecker & Sons Michael London & Associates
ITEM | DESCRIPTION QUANTITY[  UNIT UNIT COST | TOTAL COST |UNIT COST| TOTAL COST [UNIT COST| TOTAL COST [UNIT COST] TOTAL COST [UNIT COST] TOTAL COST [UNIT COST| TOTAL COST [UNIT COST| TOTAL COST | UNIT COST | TOTAL COST
ROADWAY
204 [Subgrade Compaction 1245 S.Y. 10.00 12,450.00 - 1.00 1,245.00 1.14 1,419.30 2.00 2,490.00 1.00 1,245.00 1.00 1,245.00 - -
304 [Compacted Aggregate Base (Under Curbs) 75 C.Y. 35.00 2,625.00 - 25.00 1,875.00 42.70 3,202.50 85.00 6,375.00 35.50 2,662.50 28.00 2,100.00 - -
304 [Compacted Aggregate Base (Under Walks & Under Drives) 118 C.Y. 35.00 4,130.00 - 26.00 3,068.00 42.70 5,038.60 115.00 13,570.00 38.44 4,535.92 28.00 3,304.00 - -
304 [Compacted Aggregate Base (Street) 50 C.Y. 35.00 1,750.00 - 25.00 1,250.00 42.73 2,136.50 65.00 3,250.00 35.50 1,775.00 28.00 1,400.00 - -
304 [Gravel Drive Repair 2 C.Y. 35.00 70.00 - 26.00 52.00 31.91 63.82 85.00 170.00 58.50 117.00 28.00 56.00 - -
407 |Tack Coat @ 0.2 gal/S.Y. 53 GAL. 1.50 79.50 - 11.00 583.00 11.16 591.48 10.00 530.00 6.00 318.00 10.00 530.00 - -
448 |Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course Type 2, PG 64-22 (Avg.1 3/4") 13 C.Y. 175.00 2,275.00 - 220.00 2,860.00 223.30 2,902.90 222.00 2,886.00 351.00 4,563.00 205.00 2,665.00 - -
448 |Asphalt Concrete Surface Course, Type 1, PG 64-22, (Avg. 1 1/4" 9 C.Y. 175.00 1,575.00 - 220.00 1,980.00 223.30 2,009.70 222.00 1,998.00 351.00 3,159.00 205.00 1,845.00 - -
448 |Asphalt Drive Repair 13 C.Y. 175.00 2,275.00 - 220.00 2,860.00 266.18 3,460.34 222.00 2,886.00 351.00 4,563.00 205.00 2,665.00 - -
452 |Concrete Drive Repair 6 S.Y. 50.00 300.00 - 38.00 228.00 52.43 314.58 45.00 270.00 47.40 284.40 38.00 228.00 - -
452 |Driveway Apron (6" Residential) 25 S.Y. 50.00 1,250.00 - 38.00 950.00 47.10 1,177.50 40.00 1,000.00 40.00 1,000.00 37.00 925.00 - -
452 |Driveway Apron (8" Commercial) 216 S.Y. 55.00 11,880.00 - 42.00 9,072.00 54.17 11,700.72 45.00 9,720.00 47.40 10,238.40 44.00 9,504.00 - -
603 [4" Storm Sewer (Downspout Drain) 500 L.F. 15.00 7,500.00 - 17.00 8,500.00 4.75 2,375.00 4.00 2,000.00 9.45 4,725.00 7.00 3,500.00 - -
12" HDPE Storm Sewer (Labor & Addt'| Mat.No Pipe) Installed in
603 |Flowable Backfill 212 L.F. $ 70.00 [ $ 14,840.00 $ - $ 51.00 [ $ 10,812.00 | § 89.02 [ $ 18,872.24 | § 68.00 | $ 14,416.00 | $ 79.00 [ $ 16,748.00 | $ 5230 $ 11,087.60 | $ - $ -
24" HDPE Storm Sewer (Labor & Addt'| Mat.No Pipe) Installed in
603 |[Flowable Backfill 216 L.F. $ 75.00 | $ 16,200.00 $ - $ 65.00 | $ 14,040.00 | $ 111.55 | § 24,094.80 | $ 78.00 | $ 16,848.00 | $ 88.28 | $ 19,068.48 | $ 66.55 [ $ 14,374.80 | $ - $ -
24" HDPE Storm Sewer (Labor & Addt'| Mat.No Pipe) Installed Granular
603 |Backfill 623 L.F. $ 65.00 [ $ 40,495.00 $ - $ 27.00 [ $ 16,821.00 | § 39.15([$ 2439045 $ 42.00 | $ 26,166.00 | $ 3080 [ $ 19,18840 | $ 52.50 [ $ 32,707.50 [ $ - $ -
24" HDPE Storm Sewer (Labor & Addt'| Mat.No Pipe) Installed Native
603 [Backfill 90 L.F. 50.00 4,500.00 - 23.00 2,070.00 23.82 2,143.80 22.00 1,980.00 20.60 1,854.00 21.50 1,935.00 - -
604 [Storm Inlet Type 'Y’ 10 EACH 1,700.00 17,000.00 - 1,077.00 10,770.00 1,512.55 15,125.50 1,200.00 12,000.00 1,850.00 18,500.00 1,400.00 14,000.00 - -
604 [3x3 Catch Basin 1 EACH 1,700.00 1,700.00 - 1,425.00 1,425.00 1,945.40 1,945.40 1,150.00 1,150.00 1,857.00 1,857.00 1,450.00 1,450.00 - -
604 [Headwall 1 EACH 1,200.00 1,200.00 - 585.00 585.00 3,069.66 3,069.66 1,225.00 1,225.00 1,734.00 1,734.00 1,340.00 1,340.00 - -
608 [Concrete Walk (4" Main Line) 4,627 S.F. 4.00 18,508.00 - 4.00 18,508.00 3.27 15,130.29 3.50 16,194.50 3.40 15,731.80 3.60 16,657.20 - -
608 [Concrete Walk (6" Through Residential Drives) 125 S.F. 4.50 562.50 - 6.00 750.00 5.15 643.75 4.50 562.50 4.45 556.25 3.90 487.50 - -
608 [Concrete Walk (8" Through Commercial Drives) 955 S.F. 5.00 4,775.00 - 7.00 6,685.00 6.07 5,796.85 5.20 4,966.00 5.27 5,032.85 4.55 4,345.25 - -
608 [Curb Ramp 7 EACH 500.00 3,500.00 - 385.00 2,695.00 334.95 2,344.65 330.00 2,310.00 351.00 2,457.00 505.00 3,535.00 - -
609 [Combined Curb & Gutter 1,610 L.F. 15.00 24,150.00 - 12.00 19,320.00 13.07 21,042.70 13.00 20,930.00 12.28 19,770.80 10.00 16,100.00 - -
614 [Maintenance of Traffic 1 LUMP 10,000.00 10,000.00 - 500.00 500.00 4,164.13 4,164.13 3,500.00 3,500.00 7,020.00 7,020.00 7,500.00 7,500.00 - -
638 [8" P.V.C. Waterline, Installed in Flowable Backfill 70 L.F. 70.00 4,900.00 - 77.00 5,390.00 135.23 9,466.10 95.00 6,650.00 102.63 7,184.10 66.85 4,679.50 - -
638 [8" P.V.C. Waterline Installed in Granular Backfill 15 L.F. 35.00 525.00 - 34.00 510.00 47.46 711.90 70.00 1,050.00 45.40 681.00 52.90 793.50 - -
638 [8" 22 1/2 M.J. Bend w/ Restraining Joints 2 EACH 250.00 500.00 - 279.00 558.00 240.85 481.70 175.00 350.00 271.00 542.00 280.00 560.00 - -
638 [8" Resilient Wedge Valve w/ Box 1 EACH 750.00 750.00 - 1,135.00 1,135.00 1,173.05 1,173.05 1,000.00 1,000.00 1,100.00 1,100.00 1,085.00 1,085.00 - -
638 [8" M.J. Cap w/ Restraining Joints 1 EACH 250.00 250.00 - 106.00 106.00 165.87 165.87 300.00 300.00 131.00 131.00 240.00 240.00 - -
638 [Tie to Existing Waterline 1 LUMP 1,500.00 1,500.00 - 305.00 305.00 269.22 269.22 450.00 450.00 1,927.00 1,927.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 - -
Total Subtotal Bid Subtotal | $ 214,015.00 b - 5 147,508.00 b  187,425.00 b 179,193.00 5 180,269.90 b 163,844.85 b -
Contingency | $ 21,401.50
Amount as Bid Bid Total $ 235,416.50 $ 147,508.00 $ 187,425.00 $ 179,193.00 $ 180,269.90 $ 163,844.85
Difference $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - No Bid
'I:’nr?tisBliJ:rFl’_ifeROnly) tems for Unit Kramer & Associates, LLC Rath Builders Supply Inc. Arcon Builders, LTD Tom's Construciton, Inc.  Brumbaugh Construction, Inc| Double Jay Contruction, Inc.| CA Shindeldecker & Sons | Michael London & Associates
ITEM | DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT COST | TOTAL COST [UNIT COST| TOTAL COST [UNIT COST| TOTAL COST |UNIT COST| TOTAL COST |UNIT COST| TOTAL COST [UNIT COST| TOTAL COST |UNIT COST| TOTAL COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST
603 12" Storm Sewer (Pipe Only) 212 L.F. $ 8.00($ 1,696.00 | $ 4.70 996.40 [ $ 5.50 1,166.00 | $ - - $ - - $ - - $ - - $ 4.83 1,023.96
603 24" Storm Sewer (Pipe Only) 929 L.F. $ 15.00 | § 13,935.00 | § 14.55 13,516.95 | § 17.00 15,793.00 | § - - $ - - $ - - $ - - $ 14.92 13,860.68
Total Subtotal Bid Subtotal | $ 15,631.00 b  14,513.35 b 16,959.00 b - b - 3 - b - b  14,884.64
$ 1,563.10
Amount as Bid Bid Total $ 17,194.10 $ 14,513.35 $ 16,959.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 14,889.84
Difference $ - $ - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ (5.20)
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